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Synopsis This long zone of down-to-the-west normal faults bounds the
west front of north-northeast-trending Monitor Range and has
piedmont faults splaying into Monitor Valley and subparallel
bedrock faults within the range; even though these intermontane
faults only displace bedrock, they are suspected of Quaternary
movement. The southern end of the fault zone appears to connect
with the Toquima Range fault zone [1344] along the eastern edge
of a narrow bedrock divide between Monitor and Ralston Valleys.
The northern end of the fault zone appears to merge with the
Northern Monitor Valley fault [1202] along the northern part of
the west flank of the Monitor Range. Short scarps along piedmont
faults provide evidence for young movement along the fault zone.
The principal sources of data consist of photogeologic mapping.



Name
comments

Includes the Barley Creek and Morgan Creek faults mapped and
named by Schell (1981 #2844), and faults mapped with greater
continuity by Dohrenwend and others (1992 #283; 1996 #2846).
dePolo (1998 #2845) referred to most of the fault zone depicted
here as the Western Monitor Range fault system. The fault zone
extends from southernmost Monitor Valley, northeast and
northward along the west front of the Monitor Range, to about
White Sage Springs.

Fault ID: Includes faults 74 and 80 on Plate A7 in Schell (1981
#2844) and fault T11 of dePolo (1998 #2845).

County(s) and
State(s) NYE COUNTY, NEVADA 

Physiographic
province(s) BASIN AND RANGE 

Reliability of
location

Good
Compiled at 1:250,000 scale.

Comments: Location based on 1:250,000-scale maps of Schell
(1981 #2844) and Dohrenwend and others (1992 #283; 1996
#2846). Mapping by Schell (1981 #2843; 1981 #2844) included
field verification but was based primarily on photogeologic
analysis of 1:24,000-scale, color, aerial photography that was
supplemented by analysis of some, 1:60,000-scale, black-and-
white, aerial photography. Faults identified on the aerial
photographs were transferred by inspection to 1:62,500-scale
topographic maps that were photographically reduced to
1:250,000-scale for final compilation of the faults on 1:250,000-
scale topographic maps. Mapping by Dohrenwend and others
(1992 #283; 1996 #2846) is based on photogeologic analysis of
1:58,000-nominal-scale, color-infrared photography transferred
directly to 1:100,000-scale topographic maps enlarged to the scale
of the photographs. These maps were then reduced and compiled
at 1:250,000-scale.

Geologic setting This long zone of down-to-the-west normal faults bounds the
west front of north-northeast-trending Monitor Range and has
piedmont faults splaying into Monitor Valley and subparallel
bedrock faults within the range.

Length (km) 71 km.

Average strike N23°E



Sense of
movement

Normal 

Comments: (Schell, 1981 #2844; Dohrenwend and others, 1996
#2846)

Dip Direction W

Paleoseismology
studies

Geomorphic
expression

Range front fault that juxtaposes Quaternary alluvium against
bedrock, marked by discontinuous scarps and lineaments to the
north (Schell, 1981 #2844; Dohrenwend and others, 1992 #283;
1996 #2846). Koehler and Wesnousky (2011 #7175) profiled two
degraded single-event fault scarps that are 0.85 m high. dePolo
(1998 #2845) reports a maximum preferred basal fault facet
height of 110 m (85–134 m).

Age of faulted
surficial
deposits

Dohrenwend and others (1992 #283; 1996 #2846) assigned late
Pleistocene or Pleistocene to faulted deposits. Schell (1981
#2844) reported an age range 15-700 ka for the youngest faulted
fan deposits and suggested that these deposits probably are no
older than 200 ka.

Historic
earthquake

Most recent
prehistoric

deformation

late Quaternary (<130 ka) 

Comments: The timing of the most recent prehistoric faulting
event is not tightly constrained. Reconnaissance photogeologic
mapping by Dohrenwend and others (1992 #283; 1996 #2846)
and photogeologic mapping and some field verification by Schell
(1981 #2844) indicates that the most recent prehistoric faulting
event is late Pleistocene. Diffusion modeling of two low (0.85-m-
high) fault scarps on alluvium near USFS Road 004 suggest the
most recent coseismic surface rupture occurred about 44 ka
(Koehler and Wesnousky, 2011 #7175).

Recurrence
interval

Slip-rate
category

Less than 0.2 mm/yr 

Comments: No detailed data exists to determine slip rates for this
fault. dePolo (1998 #2845) assigned a reconnaissance vertical slip



fault. dePolo (1998 #2845) assigned a reconnaissance vertical slip
rate of 0.214 mm/yr based on an empirical relationship between
his preferred maximum basal facet height and vertical slip rate.
The size of the facets (tens to hundreds of meters, as measured
from topographic maps) indicates they are the result of many
seismic cycles and thus, the derived slip rate reflects a long-term
average. However, the late Quaternary characteristics of this fault
(overall geomorphic expression, continuity of scarps, age of
faulted deposits, etc.) suggest the slip rate during this period is of
a lesser magnitude. Total amount of vertical displacement in the
late Quaternary may be 1.7 m (Koehler and Wesnousky, 2011
#7175). Accordingly, the less than 0.2 mm/yr slip-rate category
has been assigned to this fault.
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